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By Patrick Hilsman

In They Fight Like Soldiers, They Die Like Children, journalist Patrick
Hilsman tells the harrowing stories of child soldiers from around the world.
These young people have been forced to fight in wars that they do not
understand, and they have suffered unimaginable horrors.
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Hilsman's book is based on extensive interviews with child soldiers, their
families, and the people who work to help them. He tells the story of a 12-
year-old girl in Sierra Leone who was abducted by rebels and forced to
become a sex slave. He tells the story of a 15-year-old boy in Afghanistan
who was recruited by the Taliban and sent to fight against U.S. troops. And
he tells the story of a 16-year-old girl in Colombia who was forced to join a
paramilitary group and kill her own father.

These are just a few of the many stories that Hilsman tells in They Fight
Like Soldiers, They Die Like Children. These stories are heartbreaking, but
they are also important. They are a reminder of the terrible toll that war
takes on children, and they are a call to action to end the use of child
soldiers.

Hilsman's book is a powerful indictment of the use of child soldiers. He
argues that the use of child soldiers is a violation of international law, and
he calls on the international community to do more to protect children from
being recruited into armed forces.
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They Fight Like Soldiers, They Die Like Children is a must-read for anyone
who cares about the future of our children. It is a powerful and moving book
that will change the way you think about war.

Free Download your copy of They Fight Like Soldiers, They Die Like
Children today.
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